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The Impact of COVID-19 
on the Future of Legal Services Delivery   
 
By Nancey Watson, President of NL Watson Consulting Inc. 

I would like to present a 360° perspective on the 
delivery of legal services and the impart of 
COVID now and in the future from in-house 
counsel, legal operations, law firms, and my ob-
servations working with both parties.  

Before COVID became a household word I saw 
an increase in the request for information about 
technological capabilities in corporate Request 
for Proposals (RFPs) particularly for large firms. 
Most RFPs had a detailed section on technology 
but mostly focused on cost savings and not as a 
communications tool. Previously “virtual meet-
ings” were just a bullet point under “client com-
munications”. Now IT is a full-blown section 
in an RFP. Due to COVID the surge of tech-
nology needs left firms reeling with huge, 
unexpected costs to improve their client 
service delivery methods.  

Both law firms and their clients needed 
critical upgrades overnight. Many 
firms were caught off guard and had



massive challenges to adapt and deliver any 
service. Firms were forced to rapidly adopt 
remote and virtual service technology. 

Medium-sized and smaller firms were lagging 
behind in technology. Updates to methods of 
communication and technology moved slowly. 
IT was primarily used to connect with clients 
via web portals. Many firms were unprepared, 
and budgets needed to be adjusted immediate-
ly. IT staff were under the gun and often 
lacked the expertise to bring firms up to speed 
overnight. Technology consultants had more 
work than they could handle. 

I think a big part of how the market has ad-
justed has had to do with technology. Tech-
nology tools and various software applications, 
like DocuSign, Virtual deal rooms, web forums 
like Zoom, MS Teams, all have transformed 
how clients deal with firms now and likely post 
COVID.  

Clients, and most firms, have come to realize 
that technology and digitization is making 
processes more efficient and expedient. We 
are all more connected than ever before. Many 
lawyers who have been working from home 
are surprised how much more productive they 
have been working away from the office. One 
lawyer said how liberated she has felt since she 
has reclaimed the two hours of her commute 
time and despite some distractions at home, 
the lower stress level (minus of course COVID) 
has been welcome.  

Trends in Service Delivery Models and 
Client Relationships 
Along with technology, upgraded security has 
been a growing concern within the legal com-

munity. It was not taken as seriously pre-
COVID as it is today. With employees and 
client working from home it has become a tip-
ping point for many clients. 

RFPs now have lengthy sections about how 
they want to work with law firms during 
COVID. Expectations are much higher for per-
sonal attention, and there are more questions 
about strategy for example: mapping out a 
scenario on how a firm would approach a par-
ticular issue are becoming more common. 

Communication, delivery of information and 
how transactions are being managed have 
moved many away from the paper world as we 
have had to learn to adopt to digitization and 
automation in a very short period of time.  
Firms are having to accommodate their 
client’s business needs, so that if a client is go-
ing paperless, the firm will have to accommo-
date part of their practice to comply with a 
client’s requirements. Whether we want to or 
not, we are all having to take a big step into 
the digitized world.  

Going forward, the digitization of documents, 
e-signatures, automation around servicing 
clients will become entrenched with many 
clients and consequently their expectations 
will be passed onto their service providers.  

I think it will be hard for the legal marketplace 
to go back to their old ways as corporate 
clients will increasingly push to move into the 
digital world because of market demands from 
their customer base.  

I think that many legal departments in the 
corporate world will be looking to continue 



this trend (post COVID) as they continue to 
review many of their traditional business op-
erations and procedures with a view to opti-
mize and make processes more efficient and 
effective.  

From a corporate client’s perspective, I am 
hearing of law firms increasingly looking in-
wards to transform their business procedures 
with a view to making themselves more effi-
cient and effective. 

COVID has been a catalyst for increased ‘belt 
tightening’ as we are all moving through a very 
uncertain economic period over the next 12 
months. As clients look to create cost savings 
and contain costs, this may impact revenues 
streams for some firms. Consequently, firms 
will need to do everything they can to mitigate 
against lower revenue.  

Some law firm CFOs have said that they are 
looking at their marketing budgets, resources, 
outsourcing arrangements and other (non-
traditional) practice areas to either improve 
margins or bolster revenue. The immediate 
uncertainty of COVID forced many law firms 
to downsize staff and forced law firms to find 
immediate efficiencies – as legal services de-
mand in certain practice areas remained high 
and, due to COVID, other services such as liti-
gation, recovery, commercial restructuring, 
and insolvency, even higher.  

And, as most firms look to their receivables as 
their principal source for generating profits, 
this area may be especially challenging for a 
firm if it is looking to increase its hourly rates 
given an economically challenged environ-
ment brought on by the pandemic. What may 

impact more firms over the next 12 months is 
an increase in corporate clients utilizing com-
petitive bids as clients look to source large, 
backlogged volumes of transactional work to 
newer service providers at more competitive 
rates.   

There is of an increase in competitive bids 
amongst some industries with some clients 
wanting to take advantage of COVID to nego-
tiate better pricing arrangements. Cost esti-
mates are being asked for more often – a well 
thought out mutually acceptable cost estimate 
can mitigate missteps that may occur in many 
relationships. Some companies are starting to 
utilize cost estimates as quick competitive bids 
like a “mini pricing RFP” when they are look-
ing to hire a firm for a particular matter. I 
have seen in-house counsel send a cost esti-
mate template to multiple firms to solicit bids. 
In those instances, its usually only about price 
and wanting to “understand the math” that 
went into the quote.  

Post-COVID 
Once the bar has been raised clients will ex-
pect great strategic advice and proactive com-
munication. They will not give it up. If they 
don’t continue to get it, they will switch to the 
firms and lawyers who provide it. The good 
news is, they will become more reliant on good 
strategic advice from great lawyers. And will 
likely continue to ask for more crisis-type as-
sistance – and they won’t resent paying for 
that kind of advice. 

One of the biggest areas I work on with my 
clients is pricing. Not to belabor the point, but 
once again cost estimates are getting more im-
portant because they allow everyone to be 



more transparent. Clients want to see the 
methodology behind the pricing proposals that 
firms put forward. This is becoming increas-
ingly more important given the increased 
competitiveness because of COVID. Clients, 
now more than ever before, are under increas-
ing pressure to control their costs. They want 
to have a higher level of assurance that the 
pricing they get from a firm – whether it’s in a 
cost estimate proposal – or a formal RFP – 
that the proposal is based on real data and not 
a gut feeling.  

In terms of winning more work from existing 
clients or winning new clients, firms should be 
prepared to provide their clients with an as-
surance of their stability, commitment to in-
formation security practices, willingness to 
adopt to new technology and business prac-
tices, commitment to support a client’s opera-
tional requirements and service level expecta-
tions.  

If they participate in a competitive bid 
process, or are approached in a pricing negoti-
ation, I think it’s important for a firm to illus-
trate how they can assist a client well beyond 
its pricing arrangement. Value added services 
have become increasingly important to clients 
who are looking to establish long historical 
partnerships with firms who can add to a rela-
tionship and not only focused on the price/
revenue component. 

Provided that many of us will be working from 
home for some time to come, I think we will 
see an increased focus on information securi-
ty. It will become table stakes for many corpo-
rate clients. They will not be very tolerant if 
mistakes are made or if a firm is sub-optimally 

prepared.  Firms will be expected to make 
greater investments in this area as we move 
through COVID and beyond. 

How has COVID Impacted Competitive-
ness in the Legal Marketplace? 
Pricing is still a high priority for corporations. 
So, my advice to law firms would be get the 
data correct, have it supported by historical 
information. Be sure you pay attention to how 
you deliver your services and, as always, en-
sure the highest quality of service. Legal de-
partments are looking at pricing templates to 
be able to compare apples-to-apples when it 
comes to comparing pricing of matters and for 
transparency. Alternative Fee Arrangements 
(AFAs) will increase particularly as firms are 
offering AFAs more frequently now than be-
fore.  

I keep my ear to the ground and have heard 
from reverse auction software providers that 
more companies are looking for reverse auc-
tion capabilities. Procurement professionals 
who would have scoffed at reverse auctions a 
year ago are now taking a second look due to 
COVID. The marketplace is ripe for reverse 
auctions. I recommend that law firms get pre-
pared. 

COVID has forced new processes for law firms 
and has forced open a new front for legal com-
petition. Law firms can find advantage in cost-
ing/service delivery and springboard from cri-
sis to expand legal work. The pandemic has 
not substantially impacted demand for all le-
gal services however, as economic stimulus 
measures subside or if there are more 
COVID-related shutdowns or slowdowns due 
to more waves and variants, we can anticipate 



shrinking legal demand as some clients fail or 
shrink in size.  

Highly transactional and commoditized work 
may see some pricing pressure from larger in-
stitutional clients who may want to nail down 
pricing for a longer term beyond 12 months as 
we ride through the pandemic. Firms should 
look at creative ways to approach pricing if 
they want to differentiate themselves from 
others and stay competitive. Corporate clients 
are implementing moratoriums on pricing and 
% rate increases.  

Technology has enabled many firms to handle 
a large influx of highly transactional matters at 
a lower cost. Firms must be prepared to nego-
tiate and demonstrate value outside of hourly 
rates, value added servicing and adoption of 
technology. There is a focus on pricing during 
RFPs and cost estimate proposals. Firms need 
to get it right and understand their clients. 
Convergence strategies are also being de-
ployed, paring down panels.  

I have heard from law firm CFOs that they are 
treading very cautiously on this topic with 
their clients.  I think every client is different 
and any decision depends on where the client 
and law firm are on their partnering journey 
and what is considered fair and reasonable, 
given the circumstances we are all in. 

If a firm is participating in a competitive bid 
process, I think they should seriously review 
their economic position and not feel com-
pelled to race to the basement on low rates 
just for the sake of winning a bid. Many times, 
firms shoot themselves in the foot after they 
begin an engagement and realize that their 

pricing arrangement is not economically viable 
for the firm and may not be sustainable.  

On the topic of pricing, I think a lot depends 
on the type of relationship a client has with its 
law firms. In some areas, such as transactional 
commoditized work, there may be opportuni-
ties to revisit rates, but in other areas clients 
may feel a need to stay where they are. Re-
gardless of the strategy I believe on highly 
complex matters where senior professionals 
are typically involved will be in more demand.  

In the middle of these difficult times, there is 
opportunity. Whether we go through several 
waves or variants, both firms and clients have 
to adapt to change.  
  
We have proven that we are all capable of ad-
justing and moving to a virtual world. We 
must plan for a marketplace that permanently 
embraces that new virtual world and what it 
means to a firm’s service delivery model. 
Clients will demand efficiencies and will con-
tinue to have high expectations. What we have 
gone through and continue to go through is 
not the flavor of the month, but something 
that is transforming the delivery of services 
well on into the future.  
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